

Daniel's Park Streambank Stabilization
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: November 07, 2008
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No 08263

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	King Excavating Co.	\$25,130.00	
2.	Ohio Paving & Construction Co., Inc	\$25,722.91	
3.	Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$28,503.00	
4.	Stable Construction Company, LLC	\$28,885.00	
5.	Mr Excavator, Inc.	\$29,106.00	
6.	Savcon Inc.	\$31,402.80	
7.	Platform Cement, Inc.	\$32,000.00	
8.	Easton Leasing, Inc.	\$32,375.00	
9.	Monte Construction Co., Inc	\$33,677.50	
10.	Trax Construction Co.	\$33,928.00	
11.	D.B. Bentley Inc.	\$34,300.00	
12.	Marous Brothers Construction	\$36,316.50	\$33,316.50
13.	Vizmeg Lanscape Inc.	\$37,525.50	
14.	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$39,499.99	
15.	Aaron Landscaping, Inc.	\$53,635.00	

25 PHAN HOLDERS

City of Barberton
WWTP Improvements - 2009 Rehabilitation
Bid Opening: October 22, 2009

07348

TABULATION OF BIDS

CONTRACT	CONTRACTOR	BASE BID AMOUNT	ALTERNATE	BASE BID & ALTERNATE	
SEPARATE CONTRACT BIDS					
A	General	Kenmore Construction	3,536,000.00	170,817.00	3,706,817.00
B	Electrical	Enertech Electrical	1,269,200.00	N.A.	
C	HVAC	No Bid	No Bid		
D	Plumbing	No Bid	No Bid		
C&D	HVAC/Plumbing	Meccon	100,000.00	N.A.	
			<u>4,905,200.00</u>		<u>5,076,017.00</u>

COMBINED CONTRACT BID

A, B, C, & D	North Bay Construction	4,748,388.00	212,273.00	4,960,661.00
--------------	------------------------	--------------	------------	--------------

BID SUMMARY

PROJECT: 2009 Pavement Repair Program

OWNER: Village of South Russell

BID OPENING DATE: 2/20/2009

PROJECT NO.: 08125

SORTED BY BASE BID

BIDDER	BASE BID	BASE & ALT A	BASE & ALT B	BASE & ALT A&B
	Bishop, Dorset, & Royal Oak	Anglers Drive	Bell Road Base Repairs	Anglers Drive & Bell Road
Engin. Est	156,000.00	215,000.00	159,000.00	218,000.00
Specialized Construction	163,239.95	224,983.25	168,739.95	230,483.25
Ronyak Bros. Paving, Inc.	166,152.35	230,406.05	172,952.35	237,206.05
Kokosing Constrction Co , In	177,101.45	237,542.75	186,726.45	247,167.75

ALTERNATES

	ALT A Anglers Drive	ALT B Bell Road
Engin. Est	59,000.00	3,000.00
Specialized Construction	61,743.30	5,500.00
Ronyak Bros. Paving, Inc	64,253.70	6,800.00
Kokosing Constrction Co., Inc.	60,441.30	9,625.00

H:\2008\08125\2009 program\bidsummary.xls

BID SUMMARY

Rockefeller Road Improvements Phase 3

City of Wickliffe

Bid Opening Date: 3/7/08

BIDDER	Base Bid	Base Bid & Alternate Recycled Portland Cement Concrete Base
A & J Cement Contractor Inc.	\$641,923.00	\$635,623.00
Tri Mor Corp.	\$648,032.50	\$627,807.50
T.C. Construction Co., Inc.	\$688,297.50	\$661,172.50
Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$694,827.50	\$669,577.50
Vandra Brothers Construction Inc.	\$697,087.50	\$684,462.50
Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co., Inc	\$752,157.50	\$746,845.00
C. A. Agresta Construction Co	\$752,785.00	\$738,162.50
Kokosing Construction Company. Inc.	\$773,486.50	\$768,436.50
Perk Company Inc.	\$851,665.25	\$842,827.75

H:\2007\07388\spec\bids\summary.xls

2009 Pavement Repair Program
Village of Chagrin Falls
Bid Opening Date: June 16, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 09155

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>	
1.	Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$489,390.00	EVEN SPREAD	\$489,090.00
2.	Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc.	\$509,723.50		
3.	Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc.	\$521,010.26		
4.	Karvo Paving Co.	\$527,226.51		
5.	Barbicas Construction Co., Inc. A	\$538,363.45		
6.	Burton Scott Contractors, LLC	\$604,826.00		

SOM Center Road 2008 Sanitary Relief Sewer
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: August 28, 2008
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No 05262

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Trax Construction Co.	\$364,155.28	
2.	Snavelly Excavating Co.	\$381,006.00	
3.	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$425,058.80	\$425,058.00
4.	Mr. Excavator, Inc	\$450,358.00	
5.	D B. Bentley Inc.	\$472,500.00	
6.	JTO, Inc	\$525,429.30	\$550,890.30
7.	Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co., Inc	\$542,881.50	
8.	Grade Line, Inc.	\$550,293.76	

} REAL
NUMBER

SR 57 Improvements: LOR-20/57-16.93/16.17

City of Elyria

Bid Opening Date: April 17, 2008

Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 05169

Item	Bidders			
	Shelly Co. - Twinsburg Division	Kokosing Construction	Karvo Paving Co.	Great Lakes Construction Co.
Roadway	\$1,204,035.30	\$1,811,060.00	\$1,607,843.30	\$2,383,630.95
Erosion Control	\$649,894.58	\$653,753.65	\$664,743.62	\$661,442.05
Landscaping	\$505,282.00	\$417,033.50	\$458,880.10	\$475,886.00
Drainage	\$1,397,084.70	\$1,344,767.50	\$1,386,463.85	\$1,576,693.40
Pavement	\$7,204,981.35	\$8,086,180.05	\$8,287,433.30	\$7,509,580.30
Environmental	\$20,000.00	\$20,000.00	\$14,800.00	\$12,800.00
Sanitary	\$30,600.00	\$14,750.00	\$30,750.00	\$25,900.00
Water Works	\$9,100.00	\$7,575.00	\$7,600.00	\$9,015.00
Fencing	\$195,299.50	\$215,471.00	\$201,720.10	\$221,881.40
Maintenance of Traffic	\$605,704.60	\$678,968.15	\$1,008,766.25	\$789,367.75
Lighting	\$1,927,182.80	\$2,120,901.40	\$1,950,146.75	\$2,121,051.40
Traffic Control	\$1,874,667.90	\$1,854,644.67	\$1,901,198.78	\$1,890,054.35
Alternate Traffic Control	\$88,800.00	\$127,500.00	\$93,100.00	\$127,500.00
Structures L	\$196,239.00	\$211,602.50	\$215,944.45	\$197,899.00
Structures R	\$198,165.00	\$213,528.50	\$217,756.95	\$200,523.00
Miscellaneous	\$984,000.00	\$943,800.00	\$715,000.00	\$1,083,500.00
Base Bid	\$17,002,236.73	\$18,594,035.92	\$18,669,047.45	\$19,159,224.60
Base Bid with Alternate	\$17,015,536.73	\$18,642,185.92	\$18,685,047.45	\$19,207,374.60

\$ 1.5 MILLION

LEFT ON THE TABLE

Lost Nation Golf Course Bridges and Parking Lot Improvements
 City of Willoughby
 Bid Opening Date: January 17, 2008
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Base Bid
 Project No 07311

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1. Barbicas Construction Co , Inc	\$307,000 00	
2. Ohio Paving & Construction Co , Inc	\$307,002 18	← AWARDED LOWEST + BEST
3. Hallmark Excavating, Inc	\$313,775 85	
4. United Civil Contractors & Developers, Inc	\$316,382 30	
5. Huffman Equipment Rental, Inc	\$322,420 90	
6. Karvo Paving Co	\$324,594 75	
7. Grade Line, Inc	\$326,009 05	
8. Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co , Inc	\$332,623 00	
9. Severino Construction Inc	\$337,244 52	
10. Easton Leasing, Inc.	\$339,400 00	
11. North Coast Paving Co	\$340,483 00	
12. Mr. Excavator, Inc	\$344,085 13	
13. Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$350,417 00	
14. Trax Construction Co	\$355,828 00	\$355,928 00
15. Union Industrial Contractors, Inc.	\$361,580 27	\$378,012 56
16. Carron Asphalt Paving, Inc	\$396,390 50	

Main Street Traffic Signal Improvements
Village of Madison
Bid Opening Date: August 07, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid - Part 1 - Main St Traffic Signal Improvements - River St & Lake St
Project No 09161

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1	Miller Cable Co	\$106,765 00	
2	Perram Electric Inc	\$109,774 15	
3	U S. Utility Contractor Co., Inc.	\$113,376 93	\$113,377 43
4	Terrace Construction Co., Inc.	\$178,735 90	

Safford Street Improvements
Village of Madison
Bid Opening Date: March 23, 2010
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 09198

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	C.I.R., Inc.	\$322,901.90	
2.	Phillip Miller Construction, Inc.	\$333,064.05	
3.	Mr. Excavator, Inc.	\$366,623.95	

Hendricks Road at Hopkins Road Intersection Improvements
City of Mentor
Bid Opening Date: June 20, 2003
Bid Tabulation Summary
Base Bid
Project No. 01215

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	JTO, Inc.	\$193,385.02	\$192,480.00
2.	Trafftech, Inc.	\$209,332.50	\$208,682.50
3.	U.S. Utility Contractor Co., Inc.	\$212,105.62	\$212,103.85
4.	Burton Scot Contractors, LLC	\$223,664.25	

Lakeshore Boulevard Bikeline Improvements
City of Mentor
Bid Opening Date: June 29, 2005
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 03132

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Karvo Paving Co.	\$1,776,067.90	\$1,776,411.10
2.	JTO, Inc.	\$1,933,881.77	\$1,939,781.77
3.	Burton Scot Contractors, LLC	\$1,992,007.55	

Church Street Storm Sewer Improvements
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: March 09, 2007
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 06359

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$62,200.85	\$62,220.85
2	Trax Construction Co.	\$63,928.00	
3	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$67,649.00	} \$150 = 0.2%
4	Hallmark Excavating, Inc	\$67,800.62	
5	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$76,912.00	

Church Street Storm Sewer Improvements
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: March 09, 2007
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 06359

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

	<u>Bidders</u>	<u>Labor</u>	<u>Material</u>	<u>Calculated Unit Price</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Unit Price</u>	<u>Calculated Line Item Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Line Item Total</u>
6. 35.00 SQ YD OF (SPC) TYPE "A" PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT, ROADWAY, AS PER PLAN							
	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$25.00	\$60.00	\$85.00		\$2,975.00	
	Trax Construction Co.	\$20.00		\$65.00		\$2,275.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$15.00	\$44.00	\$59.00		\$2,065.00	
	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$21.00	\$41.50	\$62.50		\$2,187.50	
	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$40.00	\$24.00	\$64.00		\$2,240.00	
7. 32.00 SQ YD OF (SPC) TYPE "A" PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT, DRIVEWAY, APRON, OR PARKING LOT, AS PER PLAN							
	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$20.00	\$75.00	\$95.00		\$3,040.00	
	Trax Construction Co.	\$20.00	\$45.00	\$65.00		\$2,080.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$15.00	\$39.00	\$54.00		\$1,728.00	
	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$21.00	\$41.50	\$62.50		\$2,008.00	
	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$40.00	\$24.00	\$64.00		\$2,048.00	
8. 61.00 SQ YD OF (SPC) TYPE "C" PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT, ROADWAY, AS PER PLAN							
	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$20.00	\$60.00	\$80.00		\$4,880.00	
	Trax Construction Co.	\$30.00	\$30.00	\$60.00		\$3,660.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$15.00	\$44.00	\$59.00		\$3,599.00	
	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$10.00	\$51.00	\$61.00		\$3,721.00	
	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$52.00	\$30.00	\$82.00		\$5,002.00	
9. 10.00 FOOT OF (603) 8 INCH SANITARY SEWER, DIP, AS PER PLAN							
	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$50.00	\$50.00	\$100.00		\$1,000.00	
	Trax Construction Co.	\$20.00	\$20.00	\$40.00		\$400.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$60.00	\$75.00	\$135.00		\$1,350.00	
	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$50.00	\$26.00	\$76.00		\$760.00	
	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$40.00	\$40.00	\$80.00		\$800.00	
10. 16.00 FOOT OF (603) 12 INCH STORM SEWER, AS PER PLAN							
	Bill Suglia Excavating	\$75.00	\$50.00	\$125.00		\$2,000.00	
	Trax Construction Co.	\$15.00	\$15.00	\$30.00		\$480.00	
	DDD Enterprises, Inc. - Twinsburg	\$60.00	\$51.00	\$111.00		\$1,776.00	
	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$20.00	\$5.00	\$25.00		\$400.00	
	Monte Construction Co., Inc.	\$28.00	\$20.00	\$48.00		\$768.00	

\$1,400
\$480.00 }
\$1,776.00 }
\$400.00 }
\$768.00 }

PROJECT: Sidewalk Improvements Project - Phase 3
 OWNER: North Perry Village
 PROJECT NO.: 06553
 BID OPENING DATE: 6/22/2007

	Part 1 US Rt. 20	Part 2 Center Road	Part 3 Parmly Road	Totals	
Perk Company Inc.	\$566,066.75	\$182,151.78	\$448,153.79	\$1,196,372.32	} \$ 16K 1.3%
A & J Cement Contractor Inc	\$602,227.40	\$209,885.20	\$400,052.50	\$1,212,165.10	

2010 Pavement Repair Program
Village of South Russell
Bid Opening Date: February 26, 2010
Bid Tabulation Summary
Part A - Manorbrook Dr. I
Project No. 10125

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1. Specialized Construction Inc.	\$205,335.90	} \$1,500 0.7%
2. Ronyak Bros. Paving Inc.	\$206,894.15	
3. Kokosing Construction Company, Inc.	\$217,782.15	
4. Burton Scot Contractors LLC	\$224,385.00	

BID SUMMARY

2009 Street Improvements

Village of Sunbury

Bid Opening Date: 5/1/09

BIDDER	BASE BID	ALTERNATE	TOTAL BID Base & Alternate
Kokosing Construction Co., Inc	\$406,109.50	\$16,274.00	\$422,383.50
Shelly & Sands	\$407,280.00	\$18,225.00	\$425,505.00
Strawser Paving Co	\$429,629.00	\$19,183.00	\$448,812.00
Columbus Asphalt	\$435,964.40	\$18,623.90	\$454,588.30
Decker Construction	\$438,336.22	\$22,829.68	\$461,165.90

\$1,100
0.3%

{

7.8%

2007 Road Program
Village of Waite Hill
Bid Opening Date: April 02, 2007
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No 0701801

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1	Ronyak Bros. Paving Inc	\$85,817.95	} \$2,500 = 3%
2	Chagrin Valley Paving, Inc.	\$88,219.10	
3.	Burton Scot Contractors	\$91,899.20	
4.	Cunningham Paving	\$96,410.25	
5.	Schloss Paving Co.	\$104,695.00	

Ridge Road/Breckenridge Village Retaining Wall Improvements
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: August 28, 2008
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 07310

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1. Perk Company Inc.	\$407,347.00	} \$ 150 0.036%
2. Huffman Equipment Rental, Inc.	\$407,521.50	

W.B.G.

SR 91 Slope Stabilization
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: October 23, 2008
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No. 06112

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$218,510.00	} \$460 0.2 %
2.	Mr. Excavator, Inc.	\$218,973.48	
3.	Easton Leasing, Inc.	\$240,595.50	
4.	JTO, Inc.	\$248,752.50	
5.	Burton Scot Contractors	\$251,210.00	
6.	Stable Construction Company, LLC	\$265,655.00	
7.	Bonamase, A., Contracting Co.	\$269,123.00	
8.	Hallmark Excavating, Inc.	\$279,990.00	
9.	Martin Enterprises	\$291,433.81	
10.	Longo Construction, Inc.	\$331,428.00	

Bid Opening Report

09102 - Willowick Dudley Park Pavilion Building
 Opinion of Probable Construction Cost - \$85,000

BID DATE: 3/13/09

BIDDER NAME	Bond/Check	Contract A Pavilion Building/Furnishings Total
Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	100%	\$72,000
B.R. Knez Construction, Inc.	100%	\$72,500
RMH Concrete & Foundations, Inc.	100%	\$85,723.90
Royer Building & Contracting, LLC	100%	\$90,489
Burton Scot Contractors, LLC	100%	\$91,385
Alba Contractors, Inc.	100%	\$91,648
Grafer & Warrington, Inc.	100%	\$96,400
Anderson Recreational Design, Inc.	100%	No Bid
TC Construction Company, Inc.	100%	No Bid

} \$500 0.7%

2009 Pavement Repair Program
City of Willoughby
Bid Opening Date: April 17, 2009
Bid Tabulation Summary

Project No 09135

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Karvo Paving Co.	\$897,668.65	} #5k
2.	West Asphalt Paving, LLC	\$903,152.75	
3.	Ronyak Bros. Paving Inc.	\$907,159.00	
4.	Great Lakes Crushing, LID	\$928,212.40	\$928,167.40
5.	Burton Scot Contractors LLC	\$937,700.00	
6.	Shelly Co. - Twinsburg Division	\$945,574.78	
7.	Barbicas Construction Co., Inc. A	\$968,217.26	
8.	Kokosing Construction Company, Inc.	\$993,559.15	

Empire Road Watermain & Pavement Improvements
 City of Wickliffe
 Bid Opening Date: March 27, 2009
 Bid Tabulation Summary
 Base Bid
 Project No. 08290

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1. Fabrizi Trucking & Paving Co., Inc.	\$1,379,147.50	
2. A & J Cement Contractor Inc.	\$1,473,706.00	\$1,474,516.00
3. T.C. Construction Co., Inc.	\$1,477,980.00	
4. C. A. Agresta Construction Co.	\$1,494,811.00	
5. Great Lakes Crushing, LTD	\$1,521,470.00	
6. Mr. Excavator, Inc.	\$1,543,576.40	
7. Karvo Paving Co.	\$1,605,333.50	
8. Terrace Construction Co., Inc.	\$1,648,384.50	
9. Perk Company Inc.	\$1,650,741.50	
10. Trax Construction Co.	\$1,742,185.00	

Coulby Pond Improvements
City of Wickliffe
Bid Opening Date: March 07, 2008
Bid Tabulation Summary
Excavation, Embankment, Shoreline and Aerator Improvements
Project No 07452

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated to

	<u>Name</u>	<u>Calculated Total</u>	<u>Bidder's Informal Totals</u>
1.	Mark Haynes Construction	\$123,787.50 —	\$132,787.50
2.	Mr Excavator. Inc	\$140,690.17	
3.	Ohio Paving & Construction Co. Inc.	\$145,029.25	
4.	D & M Earthmoving Ltd	\$149,690.95	
5.	C I R , Inc	\$158,396.25	
6.	Trax Construction Co	\$169,928.00	
7.	D B Bentley Inc.	\$175,420.00	
8.	Grade Line. Inc.	\$179,120.25	
9.	Burton Scot Contractors	\$184,000.00	
10.	Great Lakes Crushing. LTD	\$187,757.00	
11.	Huffman Equipment Rental, Inc	\$208,849.50	