
PROJECT: E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

OWNER: City of Willowick

PROJECT NO.: 241085

BID OPENING DATE: July 19 2024

SUMMARY

BASE BID

BIDDER BASE BID

ALTERNATE       

18" Fold & 

Form Lining

BASE BID & 

ALTERNATE

REF. NO. 6    

18" CIPP 

Lining

United Survey, Inc. 1,211,000.00 409,500.00 1,402,100.00 218,400.00

Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC 1,872,807.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Insituform Technologies, LLC 1,901,850.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid



E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 19, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

 

Project No. 241085

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

United Survey, Inc.1
25145 Broadway Ave.

Phone number: (440) 439-7250
Oakwood Village, OH 44146

Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC2
232 E. Lancaster Road

Phone number: (724) 452-6060
Harmony, PA 16037

Insituform Technologies, LLC3
580 Goddard Avenue

Phone number: (636) 530-8610
Chesterfield, MO 63005
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 19, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

 

Project No. 241085

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Name Calculated Total

Bidder's

Informal Totals

United Survey, Inc. $1,211,000.00  1.

Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $1,872,807.00  2.

Insituform Technologies, LLC $1,901,850.00  3.
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 19, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

 

Project No. 241085

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidder's

Informal

Line Item

Total

Calculated

Line Item

Total

Bidder's

Informal

Unit Price

Calculated

Unit PriceMaterialLaborBidders

  1.    1.00 LS OF (SPC) PRECONSTRUCTION VIDEO DOCUMENTATION
$600.00$300.00$300.00United Survey, Inc. $600.00

$865.00$0.00$865.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $865.00

$833.00$416.50$416.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $833.00

  2.    1.00 LS OF (SPC) BONDS AND INSURANCES, AS PER PLAN
$5,000.00$0.00$5,000.00United Survey, Inc. $5,000.00

$2,000.00$0.00$2,000.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $2,000.00

$8,372.00$4,186.00$4,186.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $8,372.00

  3.   50.00 SY OF (SPC) TYPE "A" PAVEMENT REPLACEMENT (CONCRETE), ROADWAY, AS PER PLAN
$200.00$100.00$100.00United Survey, Inc. $10,000.00

$294.00$75.00$219.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $14,700.00

$427.00$213.50$213.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $21,350.00

  4.   24.00 EACH OF (SPC) DEPOSIT CUT, STORM SEWER, AS PER PLAN
$350.00$0.00$350.00United Survey, Inc. $8,400.00

$3,000.00$0.00$3,000.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $72,000.00

$39.00$19.50$19.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $936.00

  5.   82.00 EACH OF (SPC) 6 INCH CURED-IN-PLACE PIPE LINING - LATERAL, AS PER PLAN
$5,650.00$3,000.00$2,650.00United Survey, Inc. $463,300.00

$7,353.00$1,500.00$5,853.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $602,946.00

$7,045.00$3,522.50$3,522.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $577,690.00

  6. 2,730.00 FT OF (SPC) 18 INCH CURED-IN-PLACE PIPE LINING
$80.00$40.00$40.00United Survey, Inc. $218,400.00

$161.50$48.00$113.50Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $440,895.00

$172.00$86.00$86.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $469,560.00

  7.   85.00 EACH OF (SPC) CONNECTION REINSTATEMENT, AS PER PLAN
$50.00$0.00$50.00United Survey, Inc. $4,250.00

$300.00$0.00$300.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $25,500.00

$72.00$36.00$36.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $6,120.00
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 19, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

 

Project No. 241085

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidder's

Informal

Line Item

Total

Calculated

Line Item

Total

Bidder's

Informal

Unit Price

Calculated

Unit PriceMaterialLaborBidders

  8.    5.00 EACH OF (SPC) FIELD TEE CONNECTION, AS PER PLAN
$2,000.00$1,000.00$1,000.00United Survey, Inc. $10,000.00

$11,176.00$3,000.00$8,176.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $55,880.00

$22,900.00$11,450.00$11,450.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $114,500.00

  9.  290.00 VERT FT OF (604) MANHOLE REHABILITATION CLEANING AND LINING, 48 INCH DIAM., AS PER PLAN
$175.00$75.00$100.00United Survey, Inc. $50,750.00

$228.00$75.00$153.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $66,120.00

$216.00$108.00$108.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $62,640.00

 10.  176.00 VERT FT OF (604) MANHOLE REHABILITATION CLEANING AND LINING, 96 INCH DIAM., AS PER PLAN
$250.00$135.00$115.00United Survey, Inc. $44,000.00

$426.00$75.00$351.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $74,976.00

$402.00$201.00$201.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $70,752.00

 11.  150.00 SF OF (608) 4 INCH CONCRETE WALK,  INCLUDING REMOVAL, AS PER PLAN
$17.00$9.00$8.00United Survey, Inc. $2,550.00

$21.00$8.00$13.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $3,150.00

$29.00$14.50$14.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $4,350.00

 12.   50.00 FT OF (609) CURB, TYPE 6, AS PER PLAN
$75.00$40.00$35.00United Survey, Inc. $3,750.00

$100.00$20.00$80.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $5,000.00

$84.00$42.00$42.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $4,200.00

 13.    5.00 PAIR OF (611) 6 INCH SANITARY AND STORM SEWER LATERAL REPLACEMENT, INCLUDING NEW TEST TEE/CLEAN OUT A
$46,000.00$23,000.00$23,000.00United Survey, Inc. $230,000.00

$58,715.00$9,000.00$49,715.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $293,575.00

$82,607.00$41,303.50$41,303.50Insituform Technologies, LLC $413,035.00

 14.   10.00 FT OF (611) 18" SANITARY SEWER, AS PER PLAN
$6,000.00$3,000.00$3,000.00United Survey, Inc. $60,000.00

$11,420.00$2,000.00$9,420.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $114,200.00

$2,894.00$1,447.00$1,447.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $28,940.00
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 19, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

 

Project No. 241085

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidder's

Informal

Line Item

Total

Calculated

Line Item

Total

Bidder's

Informal

Unit Price

Calculated

Unit PriceMaterialLaborBidders

 15.    1.00 LS OF (614) MAINTAINING TRAFFIC, AS PER PLAN
$50,000.00$5,000.00$45,000.00United Survey, Inc. $50,000.00

$51,000.00$0.00$51,000.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $51,000.00

$68,572.00$34,286.00$34,286.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $68,572.00

 16.    1.00 LS OF (SPC) CONTINGENCY/DISCRETIONARY ALLOWANCE
$50,000.00$0.00$50,000.00United Survey, Inc. $50,000.00

$50,000.00$0.00$50,000.00Insight Pipe Contracting, LLC $50,000.00

$50,000.00$0.00$50,000.00Insituform Technologies, LLC $50,000.00
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

Alternate: Fold and Form Lining

Project No. 241085

LIST OF BIDDERS

BIDDER

United Survey, Inc.1
25145 Broadway Ave.

Phone number: (440) 439-7250
Oakwood Village, OH 44146
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

Alternate: Fold and Form Lining

Project No. 241085

LIST OF TOTALS

NOTE: Bidders Informal Totals appear if different than bid tab calculated total.

Name Calculated Total

Bidder's

Informal Totals

United Survey, Inc. $409,500.00  1.
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E. 305th Sanitary Sewer Improvements

City of Willowick

Bid Opening Date: July 26, 2024

Bid Tabulation Summary

Alternate: Fold and Form Lining

Project No. 241085

LIST OF ALL ITEMS
NOTE: Bidders Informal unit price or item total appear if different than bid tab calculated price.

Bidder's

Informal

Line Item

Total

Calculated

Line Item

Total

Bidder's

Informal

Unit Price

Calculated

Unit PriceMaterialLaborBidders

  1. 2,730.00 FT OF (SPC) 18 INCH FOLD AND FORM PIPE LINING, AS PER PLAN
$150.00$100.00$50.00United Survey, Inc. $409,500.00
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